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Faith in the American Dream never wavers
John Victor Roos
U.S. AMBASSADOR TO JAPAN

------------------------------------------

Independen c e
Day is one of
the most im-
portant holi-
days for Amer-
icans — and for
those of us
o  v  e  r s e a s ,
many of whom
are away from family and
friends, I think the day be-
comes even more important.

The Fourth of July is a time to
celebrate the values that both
define and unite us: values
such as liberty, equality, free-
dom and democracy — princi-
ples the founding fathers be-
lieved were important enough
to risk their lives fighting for
and which have since become
solid cornerstones of Ameri-
can society. As Americans
gather for festivities, fire-
works and traditional Fourth
of July barbecues, we enjoy
and exercise the rights fought

for and passed down to us by
our forefathers. If those brave
men could see how their ex-
traordinary wisdom has sup-
ported the growth and stabili-
ty of a democratic system that
has inspired people around the
world, they would surely be
proud.

As President Barack Oba-
ma noted in his recent West
Point commencement ad-
dress, ‘‘From the birth of our
existence, America has had a
faith in the future — a belief

that where we’re going is bet-
ter than where we’ve been,
even when the path ahead is
uncertain. To fulfill that prom-
ise, generations of Americans
have built upon the foundation
of our forefathers — finding
opportunity, fighting injus-
tice, forging a more perfect
union.’’

In following this faith and
seeking those selfsame val-
ues of George Washington,
Benjamin Franklin and their
compatriots that are cele-
brated each year on the
Fourth of July, countless peo-
ple have flocked to the United
States since its founding and
made the country their own.
The American Dream is as
much a part of Independence
Day as the parades and par-
ties. It makes the United
States a place where all
things are possible for people
who are willing to put in hard
work and effort. Generations
of our fellow Americans have
looked toward the future and
toiled for their dreams along-
side each other despite their
differences, continuously
fighting for freedom and the
rights promised to us in our
Constitution. In a recent high
school commencement ad-
dress in Kalamazoo, Mich.,
President Obama congratu-
lated a recent arrival to the
school who became valedic-
torian of her class, noting
that she represented ‘‘what is
continually replenishing the
energy and the dynamism
and the innovation of this

country.’’
Each year Americans and

visitors participate in the In-
dependence Day activities on
the National Mall in front of
the Capitol Building in Wash-
ington, D.C. The annual
Smithsonian Folklife Festi-
val takes place there on the
two weekends overlapping
the Fourth of July holiday to
honor the diversity of people,
culture, beliefs and histories
that forms the backbone of
the United States. The up-
coming 2010 Festival in-
cludes a special program,
‘‘Asian Pacific Americans:
Local Lives, Global Ties,’’
celebrating Asian Pacific
Americans and their tradi-
tions, which contribute to the
cultural landscape of our na-
tion’s capital and its sur-
roundings.

In our increasingly interde-
pendent world, as we cele-
brate those values upon which
our great nation was founded
so many years ago, let us also
celebrate the enduring part-
nership between Japan and
the United States. Our fates
and our fortunes are inter-
twined as never before. This
year we also celebrate the 50th
anniversary of the signing of
our security treaty. In these
past five decades we have sup-
ported and strengthened each
other. Through cooperation
and exchanges we have built
our friendship. We are allies
who share the same values of
freedom and democracy, and
together we are working to en-

sure a more peaceful and pros-
perous future for ourselves
and the Asia-Pacific region.

Japan’s hosting of the Asia-
Pacific Economic Coopera-
tion (APEC) meetings this
year, followed by the U.S. in
2011, gives us another great
opportunity to build on our
partnership. We have the op-
portunity to cooperate even
further through APEC to in-
crease trade and bring sus-
tainable economic growth to
all APEC members. As lead-
ers of the global economy we
also have the responsibility
and resources to make the
world a better place so that all
future generations will have
an even better environment in
which to grow and experience
the freedoms that we already
enjoy.

As U.S. ambassador to Ja-

pan, I am overjoyed to extend
my very first Fourth of July
greetings to all my fellow
Americans and friends of
America residing in Japan
and to express my sincere ap-
preciation to our gracious
hosts, the Japanese people, for
their continued friendship and

support. May both our great
nations continue to enjoy the
blessings of liberty.

‘‘The real deal’’: Federal police guard Jesus Ernesto Chavez
as he is brought before the press in Mexico City on Friday. AP

Corrupt cop: Former South African National Police Commissioner Jackie Selebi sits inside the
Johannesburg High Court on Friday. AP

Richard Daley

Mexico gang boss held
in slaying of U.S. official
Mexico City
THE WASHINGTON POST

------------------------------------------

The execution of a U.S. consul-
ate worker in Ciudad Juarez
this March was ordered b  y a
high-ranking drug cartel en-
forcer who believed that the
woman was dealing visas to a
rival gang, Mexican federal
police said Friday.

Jesus Ernesto Chavez, a
leader of a binational gang
that supplies contract killers
to the Juarez drug cartel, was
arrested on charges that he
masterminded the March 13
daylight ambush and murder
of U.S. consular staffer Lesley
Ann Enriquez and her hus-
band, Arthur Redelfs, an El
Paso sheriff’s deputy.

Enriquez, who was four
months pregnant, and Redelfs
were killed by a squad of com-
mandos as they were leaving a
birthday party. The attack oc-
curred within sight of the in-
ternational bridge, and their
deaths raised fears that U.S.
officials were being targeted
by warring drug traffickers.
The couple’s uninjured 7-
month-old daughter was found
crying in the back seat of their
car.

Chavez told police that En-
riquez was targeted because
she was providing visas to
members of the rival Sinaloa
drug cartel, the chief of the
federal police antidrug unit,
Ramon Pequeno, said a  t a
news conference.

U.S. law enforcement offi-
cials confirmed that Chavez is
a suspected leader of the Bar-
rio Azteca organization, a vio-
lent gang born in Texas pris-
ons that has members on both
sides of the border.

‘‘He is the real deal, and we
are glad they got him,’’ said a

federal antidrug agent, who
was not authorized to speak on
the record.

But U.S. officials also said
they were uncertain whether
Chavez was telling the truth
about Enriquez dealing in vi-
sas. She worked in the Ameri-
can Citizens Services depart-
ment, which helps U.S. citi-
zens renew passports, register
foreign births and get help af-
ter running out of money or be-
ing robbed.

The same law enforcement
officials warned that soon af-
ter Enriquez and her husband
were murdered, another Bar-
rio Azteca gang member was
arrested in Ciudad Juarez and
told authorities that the couple
was killed because the hus-
band was a sheriff’s deputy
who had mistreated Barrio
Azteca members incarcerat-
ed in El Paso.

U.S. Embassy officials in
Mexico City and FBI agents in
El Paso, which neighbors Ciu-
dad Juarez, said that the in-
vestigation was ongoing and
that they had no comment.

Mexican police said Cha-
vez, 41, served five years in a
Louisiana prison for distribu-
tion of narcotics. He was also
arrested on April 1, 2008, by
the Mexican Army, but he was
released and then quickly rose
to become leader of Barrio Az-
teca, Pequeno said.

Mexican authorities say
Chavez was also linked to the
murder of 15 high school stu-
dent athletes and neighbors
who were having a party in a
poor barrio in Ciudad Juarez
earlier this year. The Aztecas
attacked the party under the
mistaken impression that the
youths were members of a ri-
val gang of killers called the
Artistic Assassins.

S. Africa’s ex-top cop guilty of corruption
Former national police chief given
cash, gifts from drug smuggler
Johannesburg
AP

------------------------------------------

South Africa’s former national
police chief has been convict-
ed of corruption after a nation
beset by crime heard months
of testimony about its top cop
going on designer shopping
sprees with a convicted drug
smuggler.

The case against Jackie Se-
lebi, a one-time president of
Interpol, has been a chief ex-
hibit in a national debate over
whether corruption and politi-
cal meddling is undermining
the fight against crime. South
Africa’s rates of murder and
assault are among the world’s
highest.

Selebi, 60, showed little re-
action as the verdict was read
on Friday, and told reporters
he had nothing to say as he left
the central Johannesburg
courthouse. He was not asked
to post bail and is free until his
sentence is determined in
hearings set to start July 14.

Selebi, once an important
official in the governing Afri-
can National Congress, had
pleaded innocent. He claimed
evidence was fabricated for
the charge he accepted money
and gifts in exchange for
meeting the drug smuggler’s
business associates and tip-
ping him off to investigations
into his crimes.

Selebi argued he was tar-
geted by enemies who wanted

to punish him for his criticism
of an elite and now defunct
crime-fighting unit. The unit
attached to the National Pros-
ecutor’s Office — setting up
clashes with police — was
known as the Scorpions and
disbanded in 2008 after it tried
to prosecute Jacob Zuma on
corruption charges before he
went on to become South Afri-
ca’s president.

Judge Meyer Joffe, in deliv-
ering the verdict, said Selebi’s
conspiracy theory had no ba-
sis, and that the former police
chief showed ‘‘complete con-
tempt for the truth’’ during the
trial.

The red-robed Joffe said
ruling a witness was not credi-
ble ‘‘stigmatizes the person as
a liar and a person of low mor-
al fiber.’’

‘‘Every day, society in gen-
eral and the courts in particu-
lar rely on the honesty, integ-
rity and truthfulness of police-
men and women,’’ Joffe said.
Selebi has ‘‘not set an example
that should be emulated.’’

Johan Burger, a researcher
with the independent Institute
for Security Studies and a for-
mer assistant commissioner
in the South African police
force, said corruption ap-
peared to be on the rise in the
force. But Burger said that
was hard to document because
Selebi disbanded the police
anticorruption unit soon after
he took over the force in 2000.

Burger said a public con-
cerned about crime will be left
questioning how Selebi was
able to get away with wrong-
doing for years.

‘‘Although the fact that in
the end justice prevailed
should in many ways address
some of the skepticism in the
public’s mind,’’ Burger said.

Burger said many on the
force saw Selebi as an outsider
imposed on them by the ANC.

Selebi was a former school-
teacher who in his youth was
twice detained without trial
for his antiapartheid activ-

ism. He went into exile in Tan-
zania and later the Soviet
Union, where he underwent
military training. After apart-
heid ended in 1994, he was a
member of the first all-race
Parliament, and later served
as the envoy to the U.N. in Ge-
neva.

Selebi is just one of many
prominent ANC members
tainted by corruption. In a
brief statement Friday, the
party said the Selebi case
‘‘clearly indicates that South
Africa as a country is gov-
erned by laws that are applied

without any fear or favor to
anyone, regardless of their
standing.’’

The main opposition Demo-
cratic Alliance said it was
‘‘time for the many other se-
nior ANC politicians, not least
President Jacob Zuma, who
still have unanswered ques-
tions about corruption hang-
ing over their heads, to also
have their day in court.’’

Last April, weeks before Zu-
ma led the party to victory in
national elections, top prose-
cutors dropped corruption
charges against him, saying

the case had been tainted by
political meddling.

South Africa comes in 55th
out of 180 on Transparency In-
ternational’s Corruption Per-
ceptions Index, based on sur-
veys of businesses and ex-
perts. That means South
Africa is seen as less corrupt
than places like Greece, Thai-
land and Zimbabwe, but worse
than Botswana, at 37th the
highest-ranking African coun-
try.

While convicted of corrup-
tion, Selebi was found not
guilty on the second charge he
faced, defeating the ends of
justice.

The star witness in the trial,
which began last October, was
convicted drug smuggler
Glenn Agliotti. Agliotti him-
self faces trial later this year,
accused in the 2005 murder of
mining magnate and ANC fi-
nancier Brett Kebble. Agliotti
has pleaded not guilty to the
charge, claiming the death
was an assisted suicide.

Prosecutors have said that
in return for more than 1 mil-
lion rand ($130,000) in cash
and gifts over the years, Selebi
did favors for Agliotti, includ-
ing letting him see documents
British police sent to their
South African counterparts
linking Agliotti to drug smug-
gling.

Prosecutors said Agliotti
took Selebi shopping at up-
scale stores in Johannesburg
and London, paying for suits,
shirts, ties and shoes. Agliotti
also bought items for Selebi’s
sons, wife and girlfriend, pros-
ecutors alleged.

Chicago council approves tough ordinance on handgun restrictions
Chicago
AP

------------------------------------------

The Chicago City Council on
Friday approved what city of-
ficials say is the strictest
handgun ordinance in the
United States, but not before
lashing out at the Supreme
Court ruling they contend
makes the city more danger-
ous because it will put more
guns in people’s hands.

The new ordinance bans
gun shops in Chicago and pro-
hibits gun owners from step-
ping outside their homes, even
onto their porches or in their
garages, with a handgun. It
becomes law in 10 days, Cor-

poration Counsel Mara Georg-
es said.

The vote came just four
days after the high court ruled
Americans have the right to
have handguns anywhere for
self-defense — a ruling that
makes the city’s 28-year-old
ban on such weapons unen-
forceable.

‘‘I wish that we weren’t in
the position where we’re strug-
gling to figure out a way in
which we can limit the guns on
our streets and still meet the
test that our Supreme Court
has set for us,’’ said Alderman
Toni Preckwinkle, minutes
before the council voted 45-0 to
approve the ordinance.

It was swift action for a
council that typically takes far
longer to pass ordinances, but
Mayor Richard Daley — who
promised the city will not ‘‘roll
over’’ if the court ruled against
the city’s handgun ban —
clearly wanted to give police a

law they could begin enforcing
as quickly as possible.

‘‘You have to get the tools to
the police,’’ Daley said.

And even though the ban re-
mains in effect until it is
struck down by an appellate
court, Georges said it was im-
portant to pass a new law to
clear up confusion Chicagoans
might have about what kind of
weapons they can legally own
and how they can use them.

Some residents applauded
the vote.

‘‘There’s just too much kill-
ing going on (and) we need
protection,’’ said Mary Fitts, a
retiree who came from her
home on the South Side to

watch the vote. ‘‘You can’t
even sit on your front porch.’’

But gun rights supporters
quickly criticized Daley and
the city council and promised
lawsuits.

Todd Vandermyde, a lobby-
ist with the National Rifle As-
sociation in Illinois, would not
say when lawsuits might be
filed. But he said the ordinance
will be attacked on a number of
fronts — including requiring
prospective gun owners to pay
$15 for each firearm regis-
tered, $100 every three years
for a Chicago Firearms Per-
mit, not to mention the cost of
the required training — saying
they all add up to discrimina-

tion against the poor.
‘‘How are some people in

some of the poorer neighbor-
hoods who merely want to have
firearms for self-defense sup-
posed to afford to get through
all this red tape?’’ he asked.

David Lawson, one of the
plaintiffs in the case decided
by the Supreme Court last
week, agreed. He wondered if
a challenge could be raised
over the issue of training, say-
ing it is unfair to require train-
ing but prohibit that training
from taking place in the city.

Daley and Georges said
they expect lawsuits but that
they are confident they could
withstand legal challenges.

U.S. independence day

Celebration: The Foo Fighters performed on the South Lawn of the White House on the Fourth
of July last year. OFFICIAL WHITE HOUSE PHOTO BY PETE SOUZA

American beauty: President Barack Obama looks at the Grand Canyon in Arizona on Aug. 16,
2009. OFFICIAL WHITE HOUSE PHOTO BY PETE SOUZA
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