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Paraguay national day

Naoyuki Toyotoshi
AMBASSADOR OF THE REPUBLIC OF 
PARAGUAY

The Republic of Paraguay cel-
ebrates its bicentennial Anni-
versary of Independence and 
National Day 
on May 14 and 
15, 2011. On 
this Indepen-
dence Day, we 
gratefully recall 
Capt. Pedro 
Juan Caballero 
and the many 
leaders of the liberation move-
ment who achieved indepen-
dence without any bloodshed 
in 1811.

On this momentous anniver-
sary, we take this opportunity 
to offer our respectful and sin-
cere best wishes of health and 
well being to Their Imperial 
Majesties Emperor Akihito and 
Empress Michiko, and all the 
members of the Imperial Fam-
ily, as well as convey our hearti-
est and warmest greetings to 
H.E. Prime Minister Naoto Kan 
and to the  Japanese govern-
ment and people.

We also take this opportunity 
to extend our deepest and sin-

cere condolences to the victims 
and families in the recent Great 
East Japan Earthquake. The 
thoughts and prayers of all Par-
aguayan citizens remain with 
the survivors of this great trag-
edy and the Japanese people, 
and join in the sincere hopes for 
a swift recovery from the devas-
tation that ensued following the 
massive earthquake and tsu-
nami. The Republic of Para-
guay’s president, minister of 
foreign affairs, president of the 
Congress, and the president of 
the Supreme Court of Justice all 
expressed their deepest sympa-
thies and support soon after the 
earthquake, and the first lady of 
the Republic of Paraguay also 
conveyed these feelings to Her 
Imperial Majesty Empress 
Michiko.

The government of Paraguay 
offered the assistance of a spe-
cial rescue team, which had 
worked in Haiti following the 
earthquake in 2010, but be-
cause of the particular condi-
tions and needs in the devas-
tated areas, this assistance did 
not come to fruition. On the 
other hand, other help poured 
in from the Paraguayan private 
sector. Of note is the donation 

of 1 million individually 
packed boxes of tofu made 
from Paraguayan non-trans-
genic soybeans and distributed 
directly to the victims of the 
earthquake and tsunami; the 
production and distribution 
cost of which was jointly fi-
nanced by the Paraguayan gov-
ernment and some private or-
ganizations in Paraguay. 

We are absolutely certain 
that the victims suffering from 
this great calamity will over-
come the many difficulties and 

challenges by virtue of their 
wisdom and esprit de corps. 
The Japanese people have 
shown us their incredible moral 
virtues, resilience and stoicism, 
and kept absolute calm during 
and after the massive earth-
quake with a complete absence 
of panic. As citizens rushed to 
purchase bottled water and 
supplies thinned amid news of 
potential radioactivity from the 
Fukushima nuclear plant, the 
price of bottled water remained 
stable in an incredible demon-

stration of societal civility and 
moral cohesion.

Paraguay’s strong relation-
ship with Japan dates back to 
1919, when the first treaty of 
amity was signed between the 
two nations. In 1936, the first 
81 Japanese immigrants landed 
in Paraguay and settled in La 
Colmena, 130 km southeast of 
Asunción, the capital of Para-
guay. The advent of World War 
II interrupted the flow of immi-
gration thereafter, which re-
sumed in 1954 a little while af-
ter the conclusion of the war in 
1945. With the aid of the Para-
guayan and Japanese govern-
ment, the immigration contin-
ued and today over 7,000 Japa-
nese and their immediate de-
scendants now live in several 
parts of the country. Most Japa-
nese immigrants engaged in 
agriculture and introduced to-
matoes and many garden veg-
etables not commonly known 
or widely consumed before in 
Paraguay. In later years, many 
of the Japanese-Paraguayan 
farmers began growing soy-
beans, a staple from their na-
tive country. Soybean produc-
tion is today the most impor-
tant product produced and ex-

ported, and Paraguay is the 
fourth largest soybean exporter 
in the world.

The Japanese immigrants 
and their descendants’ arduous 
and intensive work and efforts 
to prepare the land for agricul-
ture with little or no mecha-
nized tools contributed greatly 
to the advancement of modern 
agriculture in the country and 
the overall development and 
growth of the Paraguayan 
economy. They have earned 
deep appreciation and respect 
from their Paraguayan counter-
parts as honest and hardwork-
ing people.

On the other hand, the Japa-
nese government has greatly 
aided Paraguay’s socioeconom-
ic development in the fields of 
infrastructure, health and edu-
cation in the form of special fi-
nancial loans, free financial aid, 
technical training and assis-
tance. 

The Imperial Family has also 
greatly contributed to further 
enhance the excellent bilateral 
relations, blessing the country 
with numerous visits. Their Im-
perial Majesties, then Crown 
Prince Akihito and Crown 
Princess Michiko, visited Para-

guay for the first time in 1978. 
In 1986, Their Imperial High-
nesses Prince Hitachi and Prin-
cess Hanako visited to com-
memorate the 50th Anniversa-
ry of the Japanese Immigration 
to Paraguay. In 1999, Their Im-
perial Highnesses Prince Taka-
mado and Princess Hisako vis-
ited us for the South American 
Soccer Tournament. And in 
2006, His Imperial Highness 
Prince Akishino visited Para-
guay to celebrate the 70th An-
niversary of the Japanese Im-
migration. The Imperial family 
members as well as many rep-
resentatives of the Japanese 
government have always been 
warmly welcomed and appreci-

ated by the citizens of Paraguay 
and share fond memories of 
their visits over the last 30 
years.

Lastly, as ambassador of the 
Republic of Paraguay in Japan, I 
would like to extend my grati-
tude to the Japanese govern-
ment and people for their hospi-
tality and support. I am very 
happy to be able to celebrate the 
bicentennial Anniversary of our 
Independence Day together 
with my fellow Paraguayan citi-
zens who live in Japan alongside 
our Japanese friends, and share 
the joy and depth of our friend-
ship and respect, especially 
during these difficult times in 
our host nation.

Paraguay marks bicentennial Independence Day

Renewable energy: Itaipu Dam, on the Parana River on the 
border of Paraguay and Brazil, is one of the largest hydroelectric 
facilities in the world. EMBASSY OF PARAGUAY

Close ties: A Japan-Paraguay Immigration Agreement was 
concluded in 1959. EMBASSY OF PARAGUAY

Cairo
THE WASHINGTON POST, AP

Egyptian authorities have or-
dered the detention of the wife 
of ousted President Hosni 
Mubarak, state media reported 
Friday, the latest move in a wid-
ening probe into the source of 
the family’s wealth.

A report on the website of the 
government-run Middle East 
News Agency said the former 
first lady will be detained for 15 
days as the investigation into al-
legations of corruption contin-
ues.

Suzanne Mubarak, 70, the 
public face of many of the ruling 
party’s social and welfare pro-
grams, became an influential 
figure during Mubarak’s three 
decades in power.

It was not immediately clear 
whether she was taken into cus-
tody Friday or simply ordered to 
come in.  She later was hospital-
ized in an intensive care unit 
Friday after suffering severe 
chest pains. The director of the 
hospital said she had a heart 
problem and was in unstable 
condition at the hospital in the 
Red Sea resort community of 
Sharm el-Sheik, where the 
Mubaraks fled on Feb. 11 after 
an uprising forced him to quit. 

The former leader himself 
also has been hospitalized since 
April 13, when prosecutors or-
dered his arrest. Officials have 
said they expect to move him to 
Cairo for interrogation when he 
is healthy enough to travel.

 Investigators acting at the di-
rection of the country’s interim 

military leaders have been try-
ing to ascertain the source of 
the Mubarak family’s wealth.

Rooting out the graft and cro-
nyism for which Mubarak’s Na-
tional Democratic Party became 
infamous was one of the de-
mands of the leaders of the rev-
olution. Mubarak has denied 
the allegations of corruption. He 
also faces charges stemming 
from the killing of demonstra-
tors during the early days of the 
uprising.

Mubarak’s sons, Gamal, long 
deemed the heir to the presi-
dency, and Alaa, were-detained 
the same day he was. They are 
being held in a Cairo prison.

 Once a low-key first lady 
known for her focus on women 
and children rights, Mrs. 
Mubarak had in the last decade 
become known as a powerful 
mover in Egyptian politics.

She was believed to be a 
strong backer of Gamal’s efforts 
to succeed his father as well as 
Alaa’s business activities. She 
was known to have a say in the 
promotion of senior officials. In-
stitutions and schools carrying 
her name mushroomed in re-
cent years.

Egypt officials 
order wife of 
Mubarak held

Suzanne Mubarak

Out in force: An image grab taken from a video posted on YouTube shows Syrian protesters holding a banner saluting international 
news networks for their coverage of the unrest during a rally in Kafr Nabl on Friday. AFP-JIJI

Beirut
THE WASHINGTON POST

A top government adviser said 
Friday that Syria plans to re-
spond to what she called the 
legitimate demands of peaceful 
protesters, after Syrians again de-
fied troops and tanks to demon-
strate around the country, sug-
gesting that the regime is starting 
to realize that its strategy of using 
overwhelming force to quell the 
stubborn opposition movement 
is failing.

Tens of thousands of Syrians 
poured onto the streets after Fri-
day prayers in dozens of towns 
and villages in defiance of the 
crackdown, in which tanks have 
pounded neighborhoods where 
protests were held and thou-
sands of people who had joined 
demonstrations have been de-
tained.

Activists said six protesters 
were shot dead in three sepa-
rate locations, and though the 
toll could rise as reports emerge 
from remote areas and late-run-
ning protests, it was far lower 
than those of previous Fridays, 
when scores of people died.

Government adviser Bouthai-
na Shaaban said the toll was 
lower because last week’s pro-
tests were peaceful.

“There is a difference between 
peaceful protesters and armed 

groups,” she said, speaking by 
telephone from Damascus. “We 
don’t crush peaceful protests 
by force. Our problem is with 
armed groups.”

“Protesters went to the streets 
around the country and protest-
ed by peaceful means,” she add-
ed. “There are peaceful protests 
demanding legitimate demands, 

and the government is going to 
respond to those demands.”

It was the first time the gov-
ernment has acknowledged that 
widespread and peaceful dem-
onstrations have been taking 
place, indicating that it realizes 
the ineffectiveness of its massive 
security crackdown. Until now, 
the regime headed by President 

Bashar Assad has blamed all 
the demonstrations on “armed 
gangs” and Islamist extremists, 
summoning images of chaos and 
instability should it fall.

Hours earlier, Information 
Minister Adnan Hasan Mah-
moud said at a televised news 
conference that Syria plans to 
pursue “national dialogue” with 

opposition members, in another 
sign that the government is seek-
ing to adopt a different response 
to the biggest challenge yet to 
nearly five decades of Baath 
Party rule.

But opposition leaders and 
activists immediately rejected 
that offer, saying they would talk 
to the government only if the 

tanks and troops are withdrawn 
and the thousands of detainees 
released.

“It’s a joke. How can you of-
fer dialogue with a gun in your 
hand?” asked Wissam Tarif of 
the human rights group Insan. 
“Everyone views this as a politi-
cal maneuver .”

Mahmoud also announced 
that the army was withdrawing 
its troops from the besieged cit-
ies of Daraa and Banias. But Tarif 
said there was no sign of a pull-
out from either city.

Activists said that with many 
neighborhoods ringed by tanks 
and thousands of people in de-
tention, it was inevitable that 
some of the protests Friday 
would be smaller than in past 
weeks.

Yet people nonetheless turned 
out in dozens of towns, including 
some of those that had experi-
enced the worst violence of the 
crackdown.

 Worryingly for the govern-
ment, there were reports of 
demonstrations in three Damas-
cus neighborhoods, including 
densely populated Mohajireen, 
where activists said several thou-
sand people took to the streets. 
Video on YouTube also showed 
a small but determined group of 
protesters marching through a 
neighborhood of Syria’s largest 
city, Aleppo.

Damascus and Aleppo are 
the only two cities not to have 
witnessed any sizable antigov-
ernment demonstrations, which 
has prevented the protest move-
ment from achieving the critical 
mass of the successful uprisings 
in Egypt and Tunisia.

Syria acknowledges ‘legitimate demands’
Government 
admits protests 
for the first time
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