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I am greatly honored to have a 
chance to address readers of 
The Japan Times on the occa-
sion of the In-
dependence 
Day of Geor-
gia. I would 
like to take 
this opportu-
nity to extend 
my cordial 
greetings to 
the Imperial 
family, the 
government and marvelous 
people of Japan. It is my plea-
sure to convey congratulations 
on the Independence D ay of 
our country to the small Geor-
gian community in Japan. 

After being annexed in 1801, 

Georgia declared indepen-
dence from the Russian Em-
pire on May 26, 1918. The 
newly established Democratic 
Republic of Georgia was un-
able to withstand the Red 
Army invasion in February 
1924 that resulted to the instal-
lation of a communist regime. 
Shortly before the collapse of 
the Soviet Union, Georgia’s in-
dependence was restored in 
accordance with the Act of May 
26, 1918. A declaration of in-
dependence was unanimous-
ly passed by the Georgian 
Supreme Council on A pril 9, 
1991, the second anniversary 
of the tragedy when a peaceful 
anti-Soviet demonstration was 
dispersed by the Soviet Army 
in Tbilisi, Georgia. 

Today, the free world is chal-
lenged by expansionism once 

again endangering not only the 
Black Sea region, but interna-
tional stability, the principles 
of nonaggression and territo-
rial inviolability and interna-
tional law and order. It is 
unacceptable that the fate of 
states, their future and territo-
rial integrity is affected through 
the pressure of another coun-
try and by violent interference. 
We expect that all states, in-
cluding Russia, respect the 
sovereign right and freedom of 
each state to build relations of 
their choice, as enshrined in 
the OSCE Helsinki Final Act. 

I wish to express deep grati-
tude to Japan for the long-
standing and solid, enormous 
moral and material support of 
Georgia in the process of its 
democratic transformation. 

Georgia made a significant 

democratic breakthrough in 
2012 by achieving our first 
peaceful transfer of power 
through parliamentary elec-
tions. By conducting fair and 
transparent presidential elec-
tions under unprecedented 
amicable and constructive cir-
cumstances in October 2013, 
we demonstrated a solid step 
forward in the consolidation of 
democracy. We share the com-
mon European values and fun-
damental principles and are 
determined to continue the 
unwavering path of building a 
stronger and more effective 
democratic state where human 
rights and fundamental free-
doms are protected. 

European and Euro-Atlantic 
integration represents a long-
term strategic goal of Georgia’s 
foreign policy, which is a na-

tional idea, supported by the 
Georgian people and all major 
political parties. The facilita-
tion of the process of ending 
occupation and restoring the 
country’s territorial integrity 
within its internationally rec-
ognized borders and the safe 
and dignified return of inter-
nally displaced persons and 
refugees is our national objec-
tive as well. We highly value 
Japan’s steadfast position to-
ward Georgia’s territorial in-
tegrity. 

On Nov. 29, 2013, at the Vil-
nius Summit we initialed the 
Association A greement with 
EU, including the D eep and 
Comprehensive Free Trade 
Area FTA  agreement, which 
will be signed in June. We con-
sider this agreement as a major 
milestone for bilateral coop-
eration. 

The government of Georgia 
elaborated a draft 2020 Strat-
egy for Socioeconomic Devel-
opment, which aims to ensure 
a long-term, sustainable and 
inclusive economic growth in 
Georgia. The government im-
plemented wide-ranging eco-
nomic reforms that have 
resulted in a rapidly growing 
economy and dramatically im-
proved investment climate. For 
the last few years Georgia has 
been among the top ten coun-
tries in the world in terms of 
favorable business conditions. 
Georgia was ranked eighth in 
the world in ease of doing busi-
ness in the new “Doing Busi-
ness 2014” report recently 
released by the World Bank. I’d 

like to underline the intention 
of the government to facilitate 
the increase of Japanese in-
vestments in the energy, man-
ufacturing, logistics and 
service hub development, ag-
riculture and tourism sectors.

Today Georgia is a key link 
of the Southern Corridor and 
the shortest transit route be-
tween Western Europe and 
Central Asia for transportation 
of oil, gas and dry cargo. The 
oil and gas pipelines going 
through Georgian territory are 
the only export route for sup-
plying natural resources from 
the Caspian Sea basin to the 
Mediterranean while bypass-
ing Russian territory. More-
over, Georgia is an important 
part of all transit projects to be 
implemented within the frame 
of the Southern Corridor. 

Georgia has the second rich-
est hydro recourses per capita 
in the world. It has a well-de-
veloped power transmission 
infrastructure, linking the 
country with all its neighbors. 
Growing energy demand from 
neighboring and European 
countries puts Georgia in a po-
sition to become a significant 
provider of green energy in the 
mid- and long-term.

Georgia was historically part 
of the ancient Silk Road, a 
transcontinental trade route 
connecting Asia with the Med-
iterranean region. Georgia, 
with an outsized strategic im-
portance and more than 3,800 
years of statehood history, is 
regarded as a birthplace of Eu-
ropean civilization. Discovery 

of 1.8 million-year-old D ma-
nisi hominids just south of 
Tbilisi proves this fact. It 
should also be noted that out 
of the 14 written languages of 
the world one is represented by 
the Georgian alphabet. Recog-
nizing the uniqueness of tradi-
tional Georgian Qvevri 
wine-making, its global impor-
tance and cultural and social 
value, in 2013 the UNESCO In-
tergovernmental Committee 
for the Protection of Non-Ma-
terial Cultural Heritage placed 
the 8,000-year-old living tradi-
tion on the World Heritage list.

Ancient history and unique 
culture is partly what attracts 
millions of tourists to Georgia. 
The country has an incredibly 
rich landscape and more bio-
diversity than some conti-
nents. We have the highest 
mountains in Europe, eight na-
tional parks, 2,400 mineral 
water springs and 25 unique 

spa resorts. I’m happy to note 
the growing number of visitors 
from Japan, which in 2013 in-
creased by 48 percent com-
pared to 2012. 

More than two decades have 
passed since the establishment 
of diplomatic relations be-
tween Georgia and Japan. I can 
state with satisfaction that dur-
ing this period close ties and 
exclusive partnerships be-
tween the two nations have de-
veloped. The government of 
Japan plays an invaluable role 
in the development process of 
our country. 

I will spare no effort to in-
tensify the friendship between 
Georgian and Japanese people, 
to broaden areas of collabora-
tion, to achieve a higher level 
of economic cooperation and 
strategic partnership between 
our countries to promote a bet-
ter future and a peaceful 21st 
Century. 

Georgia looks toward expanded cooperation with Japan
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